Purchasing & Central Services
County Office Building ® 39 West Main Street ® Rochester, NY 14614
Colleen D. Anderson
Purchasing Manager

BID PROJECT: 2024 Chevrolet Vehicles

BID PROJECT #: 0310-24

BID DATE: Wednesday, April 10, 2024 11:00 a.m.
BUYER & PHONE #: | Phil DiFrancesco, ?0 585-753-1130

THE FOLLOWING RESULTS ARE BIDS AS PRESENTED AT THE BID OPENING
AND DO NOT REPRESENT AN AWARD.

NAME OF VENDOR AMOUNT BID

Group 1: $120,990.00
Group 2: $457,215.00

Axis Chevrolet Group 3: $55,498.00
676 Garfield Avenue Group 4: $229,200.00
Jersey City, NY (7305 Group 5: $191,360.00

Group 6: $58,429.00
Group 7: $128,596.00
Group 8: $312,000.00

Group 1:NO BID

Websmart Chevrolet LLC Group 2: $424,609.00
DBA Group 3: NO BID
Bob Johnson Chevy Group 4: NO BID
5049 West Ridge Road Group 5: NO BID

Group 6;: NO BID
Group 7: NO BID
Group 8: NO BID

Spencerport, NY 14559

Group 1: $112,595.00
Group 2: $487,857.50

DeNooyer Chevrolet, Inc. Group 3: $55,297.50
127 Wolf Road Group 4: $288,487.50
Albany, NY 12205 Group 5: $211,4%0.00

Group 6: $63,872.50
Group 7: $128,595.00
Group 8: $307,990.00




WHA Twelve LLC
DBA
West Herr Ford Webster

INCOMPLETE BID




